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1. Fold paper diagonally into a
triangle and open paper. Repeat
along other diagonal. Then open
paper and turn it over.

6. Fold the right and left hand
corners to the center. Repeat
on the other side.

9. Separate the four sides from
its flat position. Locate the hole
at one end.

10. Blow into the hole to inflate
the waterbomb. 

7. Fold the left and right top
flaps down (see photo) and
repeat on the other side. Then
open up the pockets

8. Now tuck the two tiny flaps
into the pockets. Repeat on
other side.

2. Fold paper along the hori-
zontal center line.  Repeat
along the vertical center line.

3. Open and turn the paper
over and collapse it along the 
creases.

5. Fold the left and right cor-
ners of the top layer up to the
top point of the triangle. Flip
over and repeat.

4. Then lay it flat.


